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Part 1A - Information required within 3 days of an

accident, dangerous occurrence or environmental incident

General information — all incidents
Where did the incident FaC"“W / field /title name Atwood Osprey f Keast Dockrell / WA-5-L
i : ,
occur? Site name and location KDAO1
Latitude/longitude 115°47° 07.337"E, 199 45’ 28.929"S
Who is the registered Name Woodside Energy Ltd
2. operator/titleholder or Business address 240 St Georges Tce, Perth, WA 6000
other person that controls
; n g :
the works site or activity? Business phone no. 9348 4000
When did the incident Time and time zone 09:00 Sheen observed, 15:00 Source confirmed (AWST)
3.
?
Qreur: Date Monday 28" November 2016
Did anyone witness the Yes or no i
es
incident? If yes, provide details below
Witness details Witness no 1 Witnhess no 2 Withess no 3
Full name | [IEEEEEEEEENN
Atwood Osprey
Phone no. {Business hours} =
Phone no. (Home) _
4, {Mobile)
Email (Business) _
T
Postal address | | G
NB: If more witnesses, copy and insert this section (4) here , and add extra witness numbers appropriately
Name | [ KEGczNzNEG
5 Details of person submitting Rasition _
’ this information [ i
Email @woodside.com.au
Telephone no. _
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8.
Initial investigations carried out by ||| (-<fer to
. Environmental Incident report attached - Environmental Incident - EI-1611-
What are the internal Ooéll) I P Vi !
investigation arrangements? '
Formal investigations into the incident are continuing.
9. Yes or no Yes
If Yes, provide details below
Hydrocarbon
o Please specify:
Type of fluid (liquid or gas) | contaminated deck drain water
Ifhydrocart.)on release please Non-hydrocarbon
complete item no.15 as well i O
Please specify
Estimated quantity 106L
Liquid (L), Gas (kg)
Calculation Measurement | O
o | Please specify:
Estimation details Estimated using sheen area/appearance method.
A combination of rainbow sheen and silver sheen
Was there any loss of was observed.
containment of any fluid .
(liquid or gas)? Compos.|t|<.)n Accumulated hydrocarbons that have collected in
Percentage and description | the clean drain water tank.
. Unknown
Known toxicity to people Toxicity to people
and/or environment Toxicity to environment Unknown
How was the leak/spill F&G detection | O Visual
detected? CCctv | O Other | O
No Immediate n
Yes | O Delayed | 4
R , No Hotwork | O
Did ignition occur: Spark electrical source | [
If yes, what was Spark metallic contact | OJ
the likely ignition Hot surface | U
source Other | U
Yes or no Yes
Undetermined, however the sheen was observed
, early and the start of the sheen was clearly
Duration of the release | . . .
" identifiable on the ocean surface, allowing
mm:ss . . . .
10. Has the release been . accurate application of the AMSA oil spill calculator
stopped and/or contained? estimate process.
Unable to calculate or measure the rate of release
Estimated rate of release | as the discharge is by gravity and the discharge
Litres or kg per hour | would have been a combination of water and
hydrocarbon.
. What or where is the | Discharge valve from the ‘clean drain water tank’,
11. | Location of release

location of the release?

via overboard discharge line.
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What equipment was
involved in the release?

Clean water drain tank

Oil in water content meter (clean drain water tank) ™=

Automatic system (contained within the electronic
Vessel Management System)

Automatic overboard discharge valve, controlled
by VMS as determined by oil in water content

meter.

Gravity discharge (head pressure only)

Is this functional location
listed as safety-critical
equipment?

No

Ambient temperature c°

28 degrees

Relative humidity %

Not recorded

. 8 knots

Wind speed m/s

NB: for enclosed areas use

Air change per hour

Weather conditions . - 194 degrees
12. Please complete as appropriate Wind direction e.g. from sw &
Significant wave height m 1.1m at 12 to 15 seconds (direction 250 degrees)
swell m | 0-03mat16to 19 seconds (direction 250 degrees)
Current speed mys | NOt recorded
Current direction e.g. from | Not recorded

SW

Process Utilities | O
System of hydrocarbon .
¥ y release Drilling | O Well related | O
Subsea / Pipeline | O Marine | O
Estimated inventory in Hydrocarbons released were not part of inventory
he isol I m .
4 b | detail the isolatab i systek Hydrocarbons were floating on top of the water
Hydrocarbon release details resorkd | contained in the clean drain water tank

13. | If hydrocarbon fluid (liquid or gas) System pressure and size Pressure Mpag | Gravity head pressure,

was released, please complete this
section as well

of piping or vessel
diameter (d in mm)
length (Iin m)

or volume (VinlL)

no pumps in system

Size Piping (d) | Clean drain tank total volume
and Piping () | 112cubic metres (was not full)
or Vessel (V)

Estimated equivalent hole
diameter

dinmm

Not applicable
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Action

Responsible party

Completion date
Actual or intended

in the future.

sample line does not oceur
again

» | I 28/11/2016
Actions taken to avoid or Detect source of the spill -_ Complete
mitigate any adverse Cease draining the ‘clean | [ GG 28/11/2016
29. | environmental impacts of | 4rain water tank’ _ Complete
the incident.
NB: If more actions, please add extra rows as required
Action Responsible party CompIeFlon sty
Actual or intended
Sensor feed tube for the oil
in water content meter on
) ) the discharge pipe of the | [ EGTGTGTGTcGcGEGIGEG 28/11/2016
Corrective actions taken, ‘clean drain water tank’ was _ Complete
or proposed, to stop, unblocked and function
30. | control or remedy the S —
incident.
NB: If more actions, please add extra rows as required
: : Completion date
Action Responsible party SN S S 7
Complete further
investigation, identify and
implement long term
Actions taken, or corrective measures to
= . [ 15 December 2016
proposed, to prevent a ensure blockage of the oil
21, | similar incident occurring in water content meter

NB: If more actions, please add extra rows as required

Are you attaching any Yes or no
documents? If yes provide details below Yes
No. ID Revision Date Title/Description
1 Environment | NA 30/11/2016 B - vironmental Incident Report

al Incident -

El-1611-

0001

Insert or delete rows as required
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Instructions and general guidance for use:

1. The use of this form is voluntary and is provided to assist operators and titleholders to comply with their
obligations to give notice and provide reports of incidents to NOPSEMA under the applicable legislation.

2. Accidents, dangerous occurrences or environmental incidents can all be reported using this same form.

3. The applicable legislation for incident reporting is:

a. Offshore Petroleum and Greenhouse Gas Storage (Safety) Regulations 2009 [OPGGS(S)R]; and
b. Offshore Petroleum and Greenhouse Gas Storage (Environment) Regulations 2009 [OPGGS(E)R], for
facilities located in Commonwealth waters; or
c. forfacilities located in designated coastal waters, the relevant State or Territory Act and associated
Regulations where there is a current conferral of powers to NOPSEMA.
4. In the context of this form an incident is a reportable incident as defined under:
a. OPGGSA, Schedule 3, Clause 82.
b. OPGGS(E)R, regulation 4.
5. This form should be used in conjunction with NOPSEMA Guidance Notes available on the NOPSEMA website:
a. N-03000-GNO0099 Notification and Reporting of Accidents and Dangerous Occurrences
b. N-03000-GN0926 Notification and Reporting of Environmental Incidents

6. Part 1 requires completion for all incidents; then ALSO complete part 2 if the incident is an accident or
dangerous occurrence.

7. NOPSEMA considers that a full report will contain copies of documentary material referenced and/or relied on
in the course of completing this form, which may include (but not be limited to) as appropriate: witness
statements, management system documents, drawings, diagrams and photographs, third party reports (audit,
inspection, material analysis etc.), internal records and correspondence.

8. This form is intended to be completed electronically using Microsoft Word by completing the unshaded cells
which will expand as required to accept the information required and the check boxes where relevant (NB:
check boxes may appear shaded and have reduced functionality in MS Word versions prior to 2010).

9. The completed version of this form (and any attachments, where applicable) should be emailed to:
submissions@nopsema.gov.au or submitted via secure file transfer at:
https://securefile.nopsema.gov.au/filedrop/submissions as soon as practicable, but in any case within three
days of the incident.

References

NOPSEMA website: www.nopsema.gov.au

TOOCS — Type of Occurrence Classification System.

The Type of Occurrence Classifications System, Version 3.0 (TOOCS3.0) was developed to improve the quality and
consistency of data. This system aligns with the International Classification of Diseases —Australian Modification
(ICD10-AM).
http://www.safeworkaustralia.gov.au/sites/SWA/AboutSafeWorkAustralia/WhatWeDo/Publications/Documents/2
07/TypeOfOccurrenceClassificationSystem(TOOCS)3rdEditionRevision1.pdf

OPGGS(S)R. Offshore Petroleum and Greenhouse Gas Storage (Safety) Regulations 2009. Select Legislative

Instrument 2009 No. 382 as amended and made under the Offshore Petroleum and Greenhouse Gas Storage Act
2006.Commonwealth of Australia.

OPGGS(E)R. Offshore Petroleum and Greenhouse Gas Storage (Environment) Regulations 2009. Statutory Rules
1999 No. 228 as amended and made under the Offshore Petroleum and Greenhouse Gas Storage Act 2006.
Commonwealth of Australia.
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Privacy Notice

NOPSEMA collects your personal information for the purpose of investigating accidents, dangerous occurrences
and environmental incidents under the Offshore Petroleum and Greenhouse Gas Storage Act 2006.

NOPSEMA will not use or disclose your personal information for any other purpose without your consent, unless it
is required or authorised by law, or relates to NOPSEMA’s enforcement activities. Your personal information may
be disclosed to the following organisations, entities or individuals:

individuals who make a request under the Freedom of Information Act 1982
the Australian National Audit Office and other privately-appointed auditors
other law enforcement bodies (for example, the police or the Coroner)
NOPSEMA'’s legal advisors.

NOPSEMA may occasionally be required to disclose information to overseas recipients in order to discharge its
functions or exercise its powers, or to perform its necessary business activities.

Information about how you can access, or seek correction to, your personal information is contained in
NOPSEMA’s APP Privacy Policy at www.nopsema.gov.au/privacy. If you have an enquiry or a complaint about your
privacy, please contact NOPSEMA’s Privacy Contact Officer on (08) 6188 8700 or by email at:
privacy@nopsema.gov.au.





